
 
 

Data protection policy: 

 
The European Fascial Distortion Model Association (hereinafter referred to as EFDMA for short) takes the 
concerns of data protection very seriously and wants to ensure that the privacy of users and prospects as well 
as the security of personal data of the users of the EFDMA website (www.fdm-go.com ) is guaranteed. 

Basically, the use of this website is possible without providing personal information. As a prospect and viewer, 
you can visit the EFDMA website without having to tell who you are. Insofar as personal data is provided on the 
following pages in the context of contacting or registering and name, address and e-mail addresses are 
collected, you can be assured that this data will be treated in the strictest confidence and protected by 
appropriate security systems. 

 
The information you provide will be processed in accordance with the current General Data Protection 
Regulation. Your data will not be disclosed to third parties without your explicit consent. 

 
The EFDMA expressly points out that the transmission of data on the Internet, as is the case with 
communication by e-mail, may have security gaps. A complete protection of the data from access by third 
parties is not possible. The EFDMA reserves the right to modify the information provided in this data protection 
policy without notice to reflect changes in legislation or jurisdiction. The current version published here is valid. 

 
The legal basis is the Data Protection Act. This protects personal and indirect personal data. 

 
The EFDMA uses cookies to make this website more user-friendly and secure and to enable you to use all the 
features of this website. None of the cookies used on the website collects information that personally identifies 
you. Cookies do not harm your computer and do not contain viruses. For more information, please visit 
https://www.aboutcookies.org/  

 
The EFDMA points out that when visiting the website, various technical information and user data of the 
visitors are automatically registered - so-called log files. These log files contain no personal data or information 
and can not be assigned to specific persons. 

 
Personal data are only collected if you provide them expressly to the EFDMA. In the case of general inquiries 
about our contact forms, your details given there, including the contact details you provided, will be stored 
with us for the purpose of processing your request or request and in the event of follow-up questions. This data 
will not be shared by the EFDMA without your consent. 

 
In addition, your data may be used to the extent permitted by law for postal mailings of information about 
offers, content and services. You may revoke the consent given to EFDMA at any time with future effect. If you 
have subscribed to the newsletter of the EFDMA, you can also claim the revocation by clicking on the 
unsubscribe link contained in the newsletter. You will receive a confirmation for both the registration and the 
deregistration. 
 
The EFDMA does not send unsolicited e-mails for advertising purposes only. 

http://www.fdm-go.com/
https://www.aboutcookies.org/


 
 
Your data will only be used for the purpose you have ordered and stored only as long as absolutely necessary, 
or only as long as the purpose you have requested it. 
 
You have the right at any time to obtain free information about your personal data stored at the EFDMA and 
the purpose of the data processing. Furthermore, you have the right to correct, block or delete this data. 
 
The EFDMA would like to ask you politely to notify any changes to your data immediately.  For further 
information on this topic, please feel free to contact the EFDMA office (office@fdm-europe.com)  at any time. 
 

Vienna, May 17,2018 
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